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PARKS RESOURCE MANAGEMENT SPECIALIST

This is professional work involved in managing and coordinating land acquisition, natural and cultural
resource management, and environmental assessment functions for the Division of Parks and
Recreation.

The employee in this class determines land acquisition priorities; prepares state and federal funding
sources for the appraisal and acquisition of properties; investigates requested properties wished to be
donated for feasibility, potential liability and benefit to the state park system; and prepares
condemnation actions in cases where outside actions threaten park natural, scenic and cultural
resources. Employee works with state and local government officials on zoning and planning issues,
acquisition and appraisal proceedings, and environmental problems that impact park resources. In
resource management, position develops policies and guidelines and coordinates the implementation
of these which governs the management of park natural and cultural resources. Work further includes
providing technical oversight on contracted environmental assessments and coordinating and providing
technical reviews on environmental assessments submitted from various state and federal agencies.
Employee monitors land acquisition funds, participates in the development of funding needs for land
acquisition, and works in identifying potential sources of funding for land acquisition. Employee
supervises an environmental specialist in the preparation, collection, interpretation and analysis of land
acquisition and resource management information. Employee works primarily under the administrative
supervision of the Parks Chief of Design and Development.

RECRUITMENT STANDARDS:

Knowledges, Skills, and Abilities

Considerable knowledge of environmental or natural science principles and practices. Considerable
knowledge of state and federal environmental regulations. Working knowledge of real estate and land-
use planning and zoning terminology and concepts. Ability to analyze technical and scientific
information and to prepare conclusions and recommendations in a concise and understandable
manner. Ability to develop policies and procedures. Ability to organize and write technical reports.
Ability to work effectively and cohesively with the general public and state, federal and local
government officials. Ability to express technical information, both clearly and in writing. Ability to plan
and direct the work of subordinate staff.

Minimum Training and Experience

Graduation from a four-year college or university with a major in parks and recreation, resource
management or a natural or environmental science and four years of progressive experience in natural
resource management work; or an equivalent combination of training and experience.


